
Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)  1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet 1

Meeting #8 12/13/24

Y or N Y or N Comments 
3-9 3 303 303.1; 

303.1.1
Storm Shelters (Moved) General; 
Construction

2021 Relocates Storm Shelters from 
Chapter 11 (Additions) to Chapter 3 (All 
Compliance Methods). Revised language.

N N Discuss and coordinate 
with 1305 Ch 4. 
Amendment needed to 
specify counties where 
applicable. Add Mower 
County to list.

AM* AM Y Discuss and coordinate with 1305 Ch 4. Amendment needed to specify counties where applicable. Add Mower County 
to list. Revise in rule writing for consistency with 1305 TAG CCP_21.2.

7-15.1 7 705.4 Reinstallation of Materials Consider mirror 1305/ 
IBC 1512.4 (Currently 
1305.1511.5).

AM AM Y Consensus to amend the section to match the 1305 amendment (1305.1511.5)  1305 TAG supported  carry over 
amendment, no revisions.

8-23 8 Table 
804.5.1.1(1) 
& Table 
804.5.1.1 (2)

Table 
804.4.1.1(1)

Table 
805.3.1.1(1)

L2 Means of Egress, Stories with 
One Exit or Access to One Exit for 
R-2 Occupancies

2021 changes footnote a - "non-
sprinklered" to "without an approved 
automatic sprinkler system". In 2024, 
increases to 3rd story, 125 feet, etc. 
Similar changes in 2024 IBC.

H M Further research on 
origin and impact of 
changes needed.

AM AM Y • Revise title of Table 804.5.1.1 (1) to “Stories and Occupiable Roofs  with one Exit or Access to One Exit for R-
2 Occupancies”
• Revise title of Table 805.5.1.1 (2) to “Stories and Occupiable Roofs  with One Exit or Access to One Exit for 
Other Occupancies.”
• For consistency with 1305 CCP_126: Revise third column header to read “MAXIMUM NUMBER OF 
DWELLING OR SLEEPING UNITS” and first line third column to read “4 dwelling or sleeping units”.
• Revise Table 804.5.1.1 (1) Maximum Exit Travel Distance for Basement, first, second, or third story above 
grade plane and occupiable roofs over the first or second floor above grade plan to 125  75 feet.
• Discuss with TAG per email from ICC. Propose revise Table 804.5.1.1 (1) footnote ‘a’ to read: 
“Buildings classified as Group R-2 equipped  without  throughout with  an approved automatic sprinkler 
system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 of the Minnesota Fire Code and provided with 
emergency escape and rescue openings in accordance with Section 1031 of the Minnesota Building Code shall 
be permitted a maximum travel distance of 125 feet.”

9-13 9 Section 908 L3 Emergency Responder 
Communications Enhancement 
System Coverage

New in 2024. 908.1 Emergency responder 
communication enhancement system coverage. The 
existing building shall undergo an evaluation of the 
emergency responder communication signal strength and 
coverage area within the entire building in accordance 
with Sections 908.1.1 and 908.1.2.
Exception: Where it is determined by the fire code official 
that the emergency responder communication 
enhancement system (ERCES) is not needed.
908.1.1 Evaluation. The evaluation shall determine the 
current signal strength and coverage capabilities of the 
public safety communication systems utilized by the 
jurisdiction, measured at the exterior of the building.
908.1.2 Compliance. The evaluation report shall be 
submitted for approval by the fire code official and the 
frequency license holder. Where the coverage area, signal 
strength or DAQ does not comply with Section 510 of the 
International Fire Code, the existing building shall be
provided with ERCES coverage. The fire code official is 
authorized to establish the timeframe for such installation 
or modification.

H M Follow fire code lead - 
TAG generally likes the 
idea of removing 
specific language to 
reference fire code, but 
question remains 
whether U of M could 
enforce this because in 
fire code it will be in an 
appendix. Also 
coordinate with 7511 
and 1305. 

AM Tabled until coordination with 1305 and 7511, then return to 1311 TAG at final meeting. 12/10/24 Proposed rule 
language, coordinated with SMF: 908.1 Emergency responder communications enhancement system 
coverage. An approved in-building emergency responder communications enhancement system (ERCES) 
for emergency responders shall be provided as required in jurisdictions where Appendix Q of the 
Minnesota State Fire Code has been adopted via ordinance or where otherwise required by law or 
ordinance in accordance with MR 7511.0510.1 and 7511.0510.2.

20
24

 IE
BC

 C
ha

pt
er

TA
G

 G
ro

up
Co

ns
en

su
s

St
ak

eh
ol

de
r

Co
ns

en
su

s

To Be Completed by TAG Leads

Staff Comment St
af

f 
Re

co
m

m
en

da
tio

n

TA
G

 
Re

co
m

m
en

da
tio

n

2021 IEBC 
Code
Section

Item 
Number

2024 IEBC 
Code
Section

2020 MN Code
Section

Code Section 
Heading/Topic

TAG Meeting Results
Recommendations:    A - Accept Model Code    AM - Amend Model Code    D - Delete MN Amendment  R - Reject    WD - CCP Withdrawn

M
N

Am
en

dm
en

t?

Description of change(s) to code 
language

Safety/
Health 
Value

Cost 
Impact

N - None, L - Low, 
M-Med, H-High

12/11/2024



Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)  1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet 2

15-1 15 Section 15 Construction Safeguards AM (D) AM (D) Y Coordinate with 1305. 1305 TAG supported accepting 2024 IBC Chapter 33 except, on advice of legal 
counsel, not accepting Section 3302 Owner's Rsponsibility for Fire Protection .

Other Code Change Proposals
CCP-9.2 10 Tables 

1011.5; 
1011.6; 
1011.7

Change of Occupancy Hazard 
Categories (Tables)

Proposed revision to footnotes for 
previously accepted code change 
proposal. Consistent with footnote 
proposal for CCP-18.

L AM

CCP-15 5 & 10 Change of Occupancy - State 
Licensed Facilities

506.1.2 - Change of occupancy to a state 
licensed faciity from an IRC building shall 
be classified to a 1305/IBC classification 
and comply with IEBC 1001.2.2.1. 1011 - 
Change of occupancy to a state licensed 
faciity from an IRC building shall be 
classified to a 1305/IBC classification and 
comply with IEBC 1002 through 1011. 

H N If accepted, renumber 
following subsection in 
Ch 5.

AM

CCP-16 1011.5.6 1011.4.1 Ex. 7 Emergency Escape and Rescue 
Openings

Language is updated to provide clarity 
that emergency escape and rescue 
opening are required when any change in 
occupancy occurs, regardless of the 
means of egress hazard level. Minimum 
opening dimensions for emergency 
escape and rescue openings are adjusted 
to align with Minnesota Rules 7511, the 
Minnesota Fire Code. 

H N AM

CCP-17 5 Table 
1311.0506.1

Life Safety and Fire Risk Table Proposal moves IRC-2 to same relative 
hazard as IRC-1 abd IRC-3. Also revises 
footnote.

M L AM

CCP-18 5 506.5 Prescriptive Change of 
Occupancy; Fire Sprinkler System 
in I-4

Proposal requires sprinklers in the are 
where change of use to I-4 occurs.

H M If accepted, renumber 
following subsections.

AM

CCP-19 10 1008.2; 
1008.3

Change of Occupancy, 
Ventilation and Heating

Adds compliance for heating and ensures 
ventilation provided. 

M AM

12/11/2024


	TAG Member Worksheet

